
A Man Moved By The Spirit 



We need to be people of 
character, AS WELL AS people 
moved by the Holy Spirit 



● The Holy Spirit was UPON him vs 25 

 

● The Holy Spirit REVEALED to him vs 
26 

 

● The Holy Spirit LED him vs 27 

...the Holy Spirit was UPON him 



Luk 1:35 ESV  The Holy Spirit will come 
upon you, and the power of the Most High 
will overshadow you; therefore the child to 
be born will be called holy--the Son of 
God. 

...the Holy Spirit was UPON him 



Jdg 14:6 The Spirit of the LORD came 
powerfully upon him [Samson] so that he 
tore the lion apart with his bare hands… 

...the Holy Spirit was UPON him 



1Sa 16:13 ESV [Samuel poured the oil on 
David’s head] And the Spirit of the LORD 
rushed upon David [KJV came powerfully 
upon David] from that day forward… 

...the Holy Spirit was UPON him 



1Sa 10:6 [Samuel told Saul] … The Spirit of 
the LORD will come powerfully upon you, 
and you will prophesy with them; and you 
will be changed into a different person. 

...the Holy Spirit was UPON him 



1Sa 10:6 [Samuel told Saul] … The Spirit of 
the LORD will come powerfully upon you, 
and you will prophesy with them; and you 
will be changed into a different person. 

...the Holy Spirit was UPON him 



Luk 24:49 ESV   And behold, I am sending 
the promise of my Father upon you. But 
STAY [kjv WAIT]in the city until you are 
clothed with power from on high." 

...the Holy Spirit was UPON him 



Act 1:8  But you will receive POWER when 
the Holy Spirit has come upon you, and 
you will be my witnesses in Jerusalem and 
in all Judea and Samaria, and to the end of 
the earth." 

...the Holy Spirit was UPON him 



Act 2:4 ESV And they were all filled with 
the Holy Spirit and began to speak in other 
tongues as the Spirit gave them utterance. 
 
 

...the Holy Spirit was UPON him 



Act 19:6 ESV  And when Paul had laid his 
hands on them, the Holy Spirit came on 
them, and they began speaking in tongues 
and prophesying. 
 
 

...the Holy Spirit was UPON him 



Act 10:44-47 ESV While Peter was still 
saying these things, the Holy Spirit fell on 
all who heard the word. ... the gift of the 
Holy Spirit was poured out even on the 
Gentiles. 46 For they were hearing them 
speaking in tongues and extolling God.  
 

...the Holy Spirit was UPON him 



Act 11:15-16 ESV  As I began to speak, 
the Holy Spirit fell on them just as on us at 
the beginning.  16  And I remembered the 
word of the Lord, how he said, 'John 
baptized with water, but you will be 
baptized with the Holy Spirit.' 
 

...the Holy Spirit was UPON him 



The Holy Spirit Reveals Things 

...the Holy Spirit REVEALS things 



Spend time in the word so He can speak to 
you 
 

...the Holy Spirit REVEALS things 



Stay in fellowship with other believers, 
because the Holy Spirit speaks through 
others 
 

...the Holy Spirit REVEALS things 



Be sensitive to the Holy Spirit when He 
convicts us of sin 
 

...the Holy Spirit REVEALS things 



The Holy Spirit Leads us -- at times almost 
imperceptibly 
 

...the Holy Spirit LEADS us 



Sometimes He directly reveals the first 
steps of HIS plans 
 

...the Holy Spirit LEADS us 



Then he intervenes - in a way his leading 
was more discovered than known 
 

...the Holy Spirit LEADS us 



The first step was to obey the angel when 
he told him to go to the desert 
 

...the Holy Spirit LEADS us 



He leads us with just enough information 
to get us to the next step 
 

...the Holy Spirit LEADS us 



Are you a man of character AND moved 
by the Spirit? 
 

...the Holy Spirit LEADS us 



If you have never been baptized in the 
Holy Spirit - Pray to receive it 
 

...the Holy Spirit LEADS us 



If you are baptized in the Holy Spirit -- 
Pray in the spirit 
 

...the Holy Spirit LEADS us 



Desire to be used in spiritual gifts 
 

...the Holy Spirit LEADS us 



Look for divine appointments 
 

...the Holy Spirit LEADS us 


