
God Has Poured Out His Love – February 13, 2010

Rom 5:1-5 Therefore, since we have been justified through faith, we have peace with God through our Lord Jesus Christ, through whom we 
have gained access by faith into this grace in which we now stand. And we rejoice in the hope of the glory of God. Not only so, but we also 
rejoice in our sufferings, because we know that suffering produces perseverance; perseverance, character; and character, hope. And hope does 
not disappoint us, because God has poured out his love into our hearts by the Holy Spirit, whom he has given us. 

God loves us even when we were at worst.  His desire is to save us.

Rom 5:6-7 You see, at just the right time, when we were still powerless, Christ died for the ungodly. Very rarely will anyone die for a righteous 
man, though for a good man someone might possibly dare to die. But God demonstrates his own love for us in this: While we were still sinners, 
Christ died for us.

John 3:16-18 For God so loved the world that he gave his one and only Son that whoever believes in him shall not perish but have eternal life. 
For God did not send his Son into the world to condemn the world, but to save the world through him. Whoever believes in him is not 
condemned, but whoever does not believe stands condemned already because he has not believed in the name of God's one and only Son.

1 John 4 9-10 This is how God showed his love among us: He sent his one and only Son into the world that we might live through him. This is 
love: not that we loved God, but that he loved us and sent his Son as an atoning sacrifice for our sins.

Hindrances to the knowledge of God’s love:

God is just an angry, distant God waiting to punish me for what I do wrong.

Deut 10:10-11 Now I (Moses) had stayed on the mountain forty days and nights, as I did the first time, and the LORD listened to me at this 
time also. It was not his will to destroy you.  "Go," the LORD said to me, "and lead the people on their way, so that they may enter and possess 
the land that I swore to their fathers to give them."

Exodus 34:6-10 And he passed in front of Moses, proclaiming, The LORD, the LORD, the compassionate and gracious God, slow to anger, 
abounding in love and faithfulness,  maintaining love to thousands, and forgiving wickedness, rebellion and sin. Yet he does not leave the guilty 
unpunished; he punishes the children and their children for the sin of the fathers to the third and fourth generation."  Moses bowed to the 
ground at once and worshiped.  "O Lord, if I have found favor in your eyes," he said, "then let the Lord go with us. Although this is a stiff-
necked people, forgive our wickedness and our sin, and take us as your inheritance." 

 Then the LORD said: "I am making a covenant with you. Before all your people I will do wonders never before done in any nation in all the 
world. The people you live among will see how awesome is the work that I, the LORD, will do for you.

God is angry at me because of my failings.  God could never love me.

Hosea 11:7-9 My people are determined to turn from me. Even if they call to the Most High, he will by no means exalt them.  "How can I give 
you up, Ephraim? How can I hand you over, Israel? How can I treat you like Admah? 
How can I make you like Zeboiim?  My heart is changed within me; all my compassion is aroused. I will not carry out my fierce anger,  nor 
will I turn and devastate Ephraim. For I am God, and not man—  the Holy One among you. 
 I will not come in wrath.

Jeremiah 31:3-4 The LORD appeared to us in the past, saying:  "I have loved you with an everlasting love;  I have drawn you with loving-
kindness. I will build you up again and you will be rebuilt, O Virgin Israel. Again you will take up your tambourines and go out to dance with 
the joyful.

Hebrews 8:11-12 No longer will a man teach his neighbor, or a man his brother, saying, 'Know the Lord,' 
 because they will all know me, from the least of them to the greatest.    For I will forgive their wickedness 
 and will remember their sins no more

James 2:12-13 Speak and act as those who are going to be judged by the law that gives freedom, because judgment without mercy will be 
shown to anyone who has not been merciful. Mercy triumphs over judgment!

Luke 15:20 While he was still a long way off, his father saw him and was filled with compassion for him; and he ran to his son, threw his arms 
around him and kissed him.

God abandoned me when I needed him.  He let people hurt me.
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Deut 10-14-21 To the LORD your God belong the heavens, even the highest heavens, the earth and everything in it. Yet the LORD set his 
affection on your forefathers and loved them, and he chose you, their descendants, above all the nations, as it is today. Circumcise your hearts, 
therefore, and do not be stiff-necked any longer.  For the LORD your God is God of gods and Lord of lords, the great God, mighty and 
awesome, who shows no partiality and accepts no bribes.  He defends the cause of the fatherless and the widow, and loves the alien, giving him 
food and clothing.  And you are to love those who are aliens, for you yourselves were aliens in Egypt.  Fear the LORD your God and serve 
him. Hold fast to him and take your oaths in his name.  He is your praise; he is your God, who performed for you those great and awesome 
wonders you saw with your own eyes.

Isaiah 61:1-3 The Spirit of the Sovereign LORD is on me, because the LORD has anointed me  to preach good news to the poor. He has sent 
me to bind up the brokenhearted, to proclaim freedom for the captives and release from darkness for the prisoners, to proclaim the year of the 
LORD's favor and the day of vengeance of our God, 
to comfort all who mourn, and provide for those who grieve in Zion— to bestow on them a crown of beauty 
 instead of ashes,  the oil of gladness  instead of mourning, and a garment of praise  instead of a spirit of despair. 
 They will be called oaks of righteousness,  a planting of the LORD for the display of his splendor.

Hebrews13:5 Keep your lives free from the love of money and be content with what you have, because God has said, "Never will I leave you; 
never will I forsake you."

I am worthless and hate myself.

Isaiah 62: 4 No longer will they call you Deserted, or name your land Desolate. But you will be called Hephzibah, 
and your land Beulah; for the LORD will take delight in you,  and your land will be married.(Hephzibah means my delight is in her . Beulah 
means married )

God didn’t answer my prayer.

Luke 18:1 Then Jesus told his disciples a parable to show them that they should always pray and not give up

God doesn’t want to heal me.

Matt 8:1-3 When he came down from the mountainside, large crowds followed him. A man with leprosy came and knelt before him and said, 
"Lord, if you are willing, you can make me clean." Jesus reached out his hand and touched the man. "I am willing," he said. "Be clean!" 
Immediately he was cured of his leprosy. 

I tried God and I didn’t feel anything.

Hebrews 11:6 And without faith it is impossible to please God, because anyone who comes to him must believe that he exists and that he 
rewards those who earnestly seek him.

Embrace the Fatherhood of God.  God is a good father.

Gal 4:6-7 Because you are sons, God sent the Spirit of his Son into our hearts, the Spirit who calls out, "Abba Father." So you are no longer a 
slave, but a son; and since you are a son, God has made you also an heir.

Remaining in the love of God:

John 15:9-13 "As the Father has loved me, so have I loved you. Now remain in my love. If you obey my commands, you will remain in my 
love, just as I have obeyed my Father's commands and remain in his love. I have told you this so that my joy may be in you and that your joy 
may be complete. My command is this: Love each other as I have loved you. Greater love has no one than this, that he lay down his life for his 
friends.

John 17:26 I have made you known to them, and will continue to make you known in order that the love you have for me may be in them and 
that I myself may be in them.

Song of Songs 8:6-7 Place me like a seal over your heart, like a seal on your arm; for love is as strong as death,  its jealousy unyielding as the 
grave.  It burns like blazing fire,  like a mighty flame.  Many waters cannot quench love;  rivers cannot wash it away.   If one were to give all 
the wealth of his house for love, it would be utterly scorned.

All Scriptures from the New International Version
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